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(…) 
 
 
THEREFORE, SPIE and Subscriber agree as follows: 
 
(…) 
 
2. AUTHORIZED USERS 
 
SPIE grants to Authorized Users as defined herein online access to the Licensed Material. This grant 
may not be transferred or extended to others. For purposes of this Agreement, "Authorized Users" 
means the employees, staff, faculty, and students, including walk-ins officially affiliated with the 
Subscriber during the subscription term and other persons, which may include retired employees, with 
legal access to the Subscriber's library resources and facilities, using the authentication method defined 
in Appendix B. Alumni do not qualify as Authorized Users.  
 
(…) 
 
4. PERMITTED USE 
 
a. Authorized Users are permitted online access to the Licensed Material, and may download, save, or 
print text, search results, or other information from the Licensed Material solely for use in research or 
education. Authorized Users may only use this online access in a way that conforms to all applicable 
laws and regulations. Portions of the License Materials may be used for the purpose of creating and 
storing course packs or training materials and making them available to authorized Users. 
 
b. Authorized Users are permitted to copy and transmit brief sections of individual articles in "person-
to-person" and non-systematic scholarly exchanges of information between Authorized Users and 
specific individuals. 
 
c. Authorized Users may use the Licensed Material for text and data mining exclusively for research 
and educational or business purposes and may load, store, and analyze the results on a secure network, 
provided such use is in accordance with all other provisions of this Agreement. Information derived 
from text or data mining may be made public; however, the original copyrighted source documents 
may not be publicly distributed. 
 
 
5. PROHIBITIONS ON CERTAIN USE 
 
(…) 
 
b. Altering, recompiling, reselling, republishing, or Internet posting of any text, illustrations, search 
results, or other information from the Licensed Material, or any portion thereof, in any form or 
medium, is prohibited. 
 
c. Systematic or programmatic downloading, printing, transmitting, or copying of the Licensed 
Material, the intent or effect of which is to capture, reproduce, or transfer the entire contents of a 
proceedings or journal volume or issue, or sequential or cumulative search results, or collections of 
abstracts, articles, or table of contents, is prohibited. Other systematic or programmatic use of the 
Licensed Material that interferes with the access of Authorized Users or that may affect the 



performance of the SPIE Digital Library system, for example, the use of "robots" to index content 
without authorization by SPIE, is prohibited. (…) 
 
d. Entire articles or substantial sections of an article may not be transmitted by Authorized Users to 
persons not officially associated with the Subscriber, except as allowed by copyright status (for 
example, a Creative Commons license) or as otherwise authorized by SPIE. 
 
e. Redistribution or Internet posting of the Licensed Material in any form, except as permitted in 
Section 4 or Section 5.d, without authorization by SPIE and/or payment of an Item Fee or royalty to 
SPIE or to the Copyright Clearance Center, is prohibited. 
 
f. The Subscriber and its Authorized Users may not intentionally circumvent the SPIE Digital Library 
access control system or use any external third-party system or service to conduct unauthorized access 
and use. 
 
g. All rights not expressly granted herein are reserved to SPIE. 
 
(…) 
 
9. COPYRIGHT 
 
The Licensed Material and its contents are copyrighted by SPIE and/or the authors. The Licensed 
Material is subject to all applicable copyright and data protection and other rights of the stated owner 
and SPIE under the laws of the United States and other countries. Copyright notices in the Licensed 
Material and its articles may not be removed, obscured, or modified in in any way. Unauthorized 
copying or redistribution of Licensed Material is a violation of copyright laws. 
 
(…) 
 
 


